
ALASKA NATIVE TRIBAL HEALTH CONSORTIUM 
ATTORNEY IV 
170,000.00-235,000.00 
 
About the position: ANTHC, Alaska’s largest Tribal health consortium is seeking an 
experienced Attorney IV. This newly added position will provide assigned legal services as an 
expert in complex, and/or sensitive legal and contract issues for ANTHC including 
legal/policy research, policy drafting and supporting advocacy efforts. Reviews contracts 
and legal agreements, assists in conducting investigations and provides education and 
counsel as appropriate. 

What we’re looking for: Juris doctorate; 9 years of experience (including substantial 
experience in litigation, transactions, healthcare law, employment law, and/or Federal 
Indian law and self-governance compacting) with 3 years in federal law and self-governance 
and admitted to practice before the Alaska State, Federal District, and other appropriate 
courts. 

About ANTHC: ANTHC is the largest, most comprehensive Tribal health organization in the 
US, and Alaska’s second-largest health employer with more than 3,100 employees offering 
an array of health services to people around the nation’s largest state.   

Our amazing benefits include: Medical insurance is provided through FEHB (22 different 
federal plans to choose from; ANTHC covers 80% of the premiums); 4 weeks PTO to start 
plus 11 paid holidays; Onsite childcare; onsite free gym access with additional access to the 
APU gym, rock-climbing, salt-water pool. ANTHC offers short/long-term disability, basic life 
insurance and AD&D at no cost. Retirement options include: 401a with 3% company 
contribution and up to 5% match and 403b discretionary. Tuition reductions for employees 
and their eligible dependents at APU.  

To apply for this awesome opportunity, visit our website www.anthc.org. (Please note, our 
website is under construction from July 28-August 8; ANTHC will be accepting resumes 
during this period. Once the site is live, the application process will recommence.) 

http://www.anthc.org/careers

